

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Reno, Nevada

REGULAR MEETING OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES
May 14, 2019

TITLE: APPROVAL OF AWARD OF LUBRICATION PRODUCTS, BID #094-11-03-19, TO CARSON VALLEY OIL CO., IN THE ESTIMATED AMOUNT OF \$65,473.31, HUNT & SONS, INC. IN THE ESTIMATED AMOUNT OF \$23,415.38, PILOT THOMAS LOGISTICS IN THE ESTIMATED AMOUNT OF \$34,570.03, AND SILVER STATE PETROLEUM IN THE ESTIMATED AMOUNT OF \$30,199.11 FOR A TOTAL OF \$153,657.83 FOR A TERM OF TWENTY-SIX (26) MONTHS BEGINNING MAY 15, 2019 AND ENDING JULY 14, 2021 WITH TWO (2) OPTIONAL ONE (1) YEAR RENEWALS.

FROM: Andrea J. Sullivan, Director of Procurement and Contracts

PRESENTER(S) & PRESENTATION TIME/CONSENT: Consent

DATE REPORT WRITTEN: April 22, 2019

PURPOSE/SUMMARY: The Request for Bid ("Bid") for Lubrication Products was opened on March 26, 2019 and four (4) bids were received. The recommendation, determined to be in the best interest of the District, is to award the bid for Lubrication Products to the following vendors as outlined in the Bid Tabulation (refer to Attachment A of the Staff Report to the Board):

Vendor	Estimated Annual Amount	Estimated Twenty-Six Month Amount
Carson Valley Oil Co.	\$30,218.45	\$65,473.31
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	\$10,807.10	\$23,415.38
Pilot Thomas Logistics	\$15,955.40	\$34,570.03
Silver State Petroleum	\$13,938.05	\$30,199.11

BACKGROUND INFORMATION: The Bid for Lubrication Products was issued for the purchase and delivery of lubrication products to WCSD and the participating Cooperative Agency. The District was the lead agency between WCSD and Truckee/Carson Irrigation District.

An email was sent to those suppliers who have registered with the District's Purchasing Department to receive bids for this commodity. As required by law, the bid was advertised in the Reno Gazette Journal on March 11, 2019. It was also

posted nationally on Onvia/Demandstar and on the Washoe County School District's Purchasing website.

PREVIOUS BOARD ACTION: N/A

ATTACHMENTS:

Attachment A – Bid Tabulation for Bid #094-11-03-19

STRATEGIC PLAN: This agenda item supports Goal #5, of *Envision WCSD 2020*: "To ensure our schools are safe, secure, supportive, and welcoming environments where students and staff are able to succeed academically and professionally at the highest possible levels."

BOARD POLICY:

[Board Policy 3321 – Bids/Quotations and Contracts](#)

LEGAL: This Bid was conducted within the requirement of Nevada Revised Statutes (NRS) 332.

FINANCIAL: Total dollars recommended for award is estimated to be \$153,657.83; for WCSD the total dollars is estimated to be \$136,930.41 and for Truckee/Carson Irrigation District, the total dollars is estimated to be \$16,727.43. Funding is coming from the General Fund budget.

COMMUNITY INVOLVEMENT: N/A

ALTERNATIVES: N/A

SUPERINTENDENT'S RECOMMENDATION: That the Board of Trustees approves the award of Bid #094-11-03-19 for Lubrication Products to Carson Valley Oil Co. in the estimated amount of \$65,473.31, Hunt & Sons, Inc. in the estimated amount of \$23,415.38, Pilot Thomas Logistics in the estimated amount of \$34,570.03, and Silver State Petroleum in the estimated amount of \$30,199.11 for a term of twenty-six (26) months beginning May 15, 2019 and ending July 14, 2021 in the total amount of \$153,657.83.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT

ATTACHMENT A

LUBRICATION PRODUCTS

BID # 094-11-03-19

TABULATION

KEY:

I.S. INSUFFICIENT SPECS	NO SPEC. NO SPECIFICATIONS
L.P. LOCAL PREFERENCE	NO SUB. NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED
N.A. NOT AVAILABLE	N.S. NO SAMPLE
N.A.S. NOT AS SPECIFIED	R.A.B. REJECT ALL BIDS
N.B. NO BID	* RECOMMENDED
N.C. NO CHARGE	** CHOSEN BY LOTTERY

BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED Jenny Perry _____ DATE 4/22/19 _____

APPEAL WINDOW CLOSES ON Monday, April 29, 2019 at 5 p.m.

SUMMARY OF LOW BID ITEMS BY VENDOR

VENDOR	ITEM #'S LOW BID ON:	ITEM LOW BID TOTALS		
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	1, 11, 17, 19, 21	\$	30,218.45	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	2, 6, 8, 12, 13	\$	10,807.10	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	9, 10, 14, 18	\$	15,955.40	
Silver State Petroleum	3, 4, 5, 7, 15, 20	\$	13,938.05	
GRAND TOTAL OF LOW BID ITEMS BY VENDOR.....		\$	70,919.00	

SUMMARY OF LOW BID ITEMS BY AGENCY

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT.....		\$	63,198.65	
TRUCKEE/CARSON IRRIGATION DISTRICT.....		\$	7,720.35	
GRAND TOTAL OF LOW BID ITEMS BY AGENCY.....		\$	70,919.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT						ATTACHMENT A
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
QUANTITIES LISTED BELOW ARE ANNUAL ESTIMATES. THE INITIAL CONTRACT TERM IS FOR TWENTY-SIX MONTHS.						
WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT						
ITEM #1 Chevron URSA SP EC 15/40 Oil, Bulk						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	GALLON	GALLON PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Rubia Optima 15W40 CK4	3600		\$ 7.23	\$ 26,028.00	*
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	3600		\$ 7.49	\$ 26,964.00	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair Heavy Duty 15W-40 CK-4/SN	3600		\$ 7.28	\$ 26,208.00	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra Power 15W40 Mat# VP5915410	3600		\$ 6.93	\$ 24,948.00	N.A.S.
ITEM #2 Chevron Supreme 5W30 Oil, Bulk						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	GALLON	GALLON PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Quartz Fut.7000 5W30 SynBlnd	1045		\$ 5.78	\$ 6,040.10	N.A.S.
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	1045		\$ 5.99	\$ 6,259.55	*
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair Synthetic Blend 5W-30	1045		\$ 6.02	\$ 6,290.90	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Street Legal SB 5W30 Mat#VP3152010	1045		\$ 6.63	\$ 6,928.35	
Item #3 Chevron Supreme 5W20 Oil, (12 Qts/Case)						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	CASES	CASE PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Quartz Fut.7000 5W20 SynBlnd	5		\$ 29.34	\$ 146.70	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified, \$9.99/gal.	5		\$ 29.97	\$ 149.85	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	as specified	5		\$ 32.61	\$ 163.05	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Street Legal SB 5W20 Mat#VP3152003	5		\$ 26.79	\$ 133.95	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT				ATTACHMENT A		
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
Item #4 Chevron Rando HD ISO 32 Hydraulic Oil, Bulk (5 Gallon Pails)						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	GALLON	GALLON PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Phillips 66 Megaflow AW 32	10		\$ 33.10	\$ 331.00	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified, \$9.99/gal	10		\$ 49.95	\$ 499.50	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair AW Hydraulic Oil ISO 32	10		\$ 31.85	\$ 318.50	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra 6000 Hyd AW 32 Mat#VP2123214	10		\$ 31.70	\$ 317.00	*
Item #5 Safety Kleen Full Synthetic ATF Tranny Fluid, Bulk						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	GALLON	GALLON PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Fluidmatic NA MV ATF	770		\$ 11.70	\$ 9,009.00	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Chevron Full Syn ATF MV/226536	770		\$ 10.99	\$ 8,462.30	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair Full Synthetic Multi- Vehicle ATF	770		\$ 10.64	\$ 8,192.80	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Street Legal MV Syn ATF Mat#VP4021110	770		\$ 9.39	\$ 7,230.30	*
Item #6 Chevron Starplex #2 Grease, Bulk						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	LBS	LBS. PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Multis Complex ET 2	1400		\$ 2.200	\$ 3,080.00	N.A.S.
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	1400		\$ 2.390	\$ 3,346.00	*
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Powertac High Temp EP #2 Grease	1400		\$ 2.530	\$ 3,542.00	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra Power Red HT EP #2 Mat#VP8020025	1400		\$ 2.450	\$ 3,430.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT				ATTACHMENT A		
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
Item #7 Chevron RPM Univ. 80/140 Gear Oil (SYN), Bulk						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	GALLON	GALLON PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Synpro GO 80W140	275		\$ 21.0000	\$ 5,775.00	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified \$1.79/lb.	275		\$ 13.4251	\$ 3,691.88	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	as specified	275		\$ 29.6700	\$ 8,159.25	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra Gear Syn 80W140 Mat#VP4280112	275		\$ 13.2000	\$ 3,630.00	*
Item #8 Power Steering Fluid PSF 32 Qts., (12 qts. 32oz.)						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	CASES	CASE PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	NO BID	15				N.B.
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	15		\$ 32.110	\$ 481.65	*
Pilot Thomas Logistics	NO BID	15				N.B.
Silver State Petroleum	NO BID	15				N.B.
Item #9 Mobil HD SCA Precharged Antifreeze Concentrate, Bulk						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	GALLON	GALLON PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Shell Rotella ELC Concentrate	1500		\$ 10.420	\$ 15,630.00	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Zerex Pink Fully Formulated Concentrate/812970	1500		\$ 8.990	\$ 13,485.00	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	PTL Antifreeze HD Precharged 100%	1500		\$ 6.400	\$ 9,600.00	*
Silver State Petroleum	Shell HD PhosFree AF/C Mat#550049206	1500		\$ 8.820	\$ 13,230.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT						ATTACHMENT A
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
Item #10 Chevron Supreme 5W20 Oil, Bulk, 55 Gal. Drum						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Quartz Fut.7000 5W20 SynBlend	7		\$ 328.900	\$ 2,302.30	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified, \$6.89/gal	7		\$ 378.950	\$ 2,652.65	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair Synthetic Blend 5W-20	7		\$ 319.000	\$ 2,233.00	*
Silver State Petroleum	VP Street Legal SB 5W20 Mat#VP3152015	7		\$ 372.900	\$ 2,610.30	
Item #11 0w20 Chevron Motor Oil						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Quartz Fut.9000 0W20 FullSun	2		\$ 437.25	\$ 874.50	*
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified, \$10.29/gal	2		\$ 565.95	\$ 1,131.90	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair Synthetic Motor Oil 0W-20	2		\$ 529.10	\$ 1,058.20	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Street Legal Syn Dexos 0W20, Mat#VP3202015	2		\$ 515.35	\$ 1,030.70	
Item #12 Lucas Fuel Injector Cleaner #10003 - NO SUBSTITUTES , (12 Qts/Case)						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	CASES	CASE PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	NO BID	4				N.B.
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	4		\$ 89.99	\$ 359.96	*
Pilot Thomas Logistics	NO BID	4			\$ -	N.B.
Silver State Petroleum	NO BID	4			\$ -	N.B.

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT						ATTACHMENT A
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
Item #13 Lucas Anti-Gel Cold Weather Diesel Treatment #10866 - NO SUBSTITUTES (6 - 1/2 Gal/Case)						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	CASES	CASE PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	NO BID	6				N.B.
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	6		\$ 59.99	\$ 359.94	*
Pilot Thomas Logistics	NO BID	6				N.B.
Silver State Petroleum	NO BID	6				N.B.
Item #14 Moltan Corse Floor Dry, 25lb Bag						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	BAGS	BAG PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	EP Naturals 35 lb. bag	100		\$ 5.87	\$ 587.00	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	100		\$ 5.09	\$ 509.00	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	as specified	100		\$ 4.44	\$ 444.00	*
Silver State Petroleum	Ultrasorb Coarse 25 lb. Mat#90811010100	100		\$ 6.28	\$ 628.00	
Item #15 Windshield Wash -20 Premix Gallon Containers, (6 Gal/Case)						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	CASES	CASE PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	NO BID	160				N.B.
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified	160		\$ 13.99	\$ 2,238.40	
Pilot Thomas Logistics		160		\$ 13.80	\$ 2,208.00	
Silver State Petroleum	Krystal Kleer - 20 Premix 6/1 Cases Mat#111205	160		\$ 11.88	\$ 1,900.80	*

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT							ATTACHMENT A
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS							
BID # 094-11-03-19							
TABULATION							
Item #16 Windshield Wash -20 Premix, 55 Gal. Drum							
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED	
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	NO BID	17				R.A.B.	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified \$2.19/gallon	17		\$ 120.45	\$ 2,047.65	R.A.B.	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	NO BID	17				R.A.B.	
Silver State Petroleum	Krystal Klear - 20 Premix 55 Gal. Drum, Mat#111201	17		\$ 107.25	\$ 1,823.25	R.A.B.	
TRUCKEE/CARSON IRRIGATION DISTRICT							
QUANTITIES AND PRODUCT DESCRIPTIONS							
Item #17 Chevron Rando ISO HD 68, 55 Gal. Drum							
VENDOR	BRAND	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED	
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Phillips 66 Megaflo AW 68	8		\$ 322.3000	\$ 2,578.40	*	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified \$6.99/gallon	8		\$ 384.4500	\$ 3,075.60		
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair AW Hydraulic Oil ISO 68	8		\$ 348.1500	\$ 2,785.20		
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra 6000 AW Hyd 68 Mat#VP2126815	8		\$ 344.3000	\$ 2,754.40		
Item #18 Chevron Rando GST ISO 68, 55 Gal. Drum							
VENDOR	BRAND	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED	
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Preslia NA GT ISO 68	8		\$ 486.75	\$ 3,894.00		
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified \$12.99/gallon	8		\$ 714.45	\$ 5,715.60		
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Phillips 66 Turbine Oil ISO 68	8		\$ 459.80	\$ 3,678.40	*	
Silver State Petroleum	Shell Turbo Oil T68 Mat#6560500055	8		\$ 756.80	\$ 6,054.40		

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT				ATTACHMENT A		
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
Item #19 Chevron RPM LE 15-40 Weight (or Ursa), 55 Gal. Drum						
VENDOR	BRAND	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Rubia Optima 15W40 CK4	1		\$ 408.65	\$ 408.65	*
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified \$7.89/gallon	1		\$ 433.95	\$ 433.95	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair Heavy Duty 15W-40 CK-4/SN	1		\$ 429.55	\$ 429.55	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra Power 15W40, Mat#VP5915415	1		\$ 437.25	\$ 437.25	
Item #20 Chevron EP 80-140 Weight Gear Oil (or Dello), 55 Gal. Drum						
VENDOR	BRAND	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Total Sunpro GO 80W140	1		\$ 1,210.00	\$ 1,210.00	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified \$1.89/lb.	1		\$ 756.00	\$ 756.00	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	as specified	1		\$ 1,631.85	\$ 1,631.85	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra Gear Syn 80W140, Mat#VP4280112	1		\$ 726.00	\$ 726.00	*
Item #21 Chevron Tractor Hydraulic Oil (Red Tint), 55 Gal. Drum						
VENDOR	BRAND	QTY.	DRUMS	DRUM PRICE	EXT. PRICE	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Safety Kleen Eco Power UTF	1		\$ 328.90	\$ 328.90	*
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	as specified \$8.99/gallon	1		\$ 494.45	\$ 494.45	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Sinclair Universal Tractor Hyd, Fluid	1		\$ 394.90	\$ 394.90	
Silver State Petroleum	VP Ultra Universal Tractor Fld, Mat#VP2012015	1		\$ 357.00	\$ 357.00	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT						ATTACHMENT A	
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS							
BID # 094-11-03-19							
TABULATION							
BALANCE OF LINE PRODUCTS							
Item #22 Brake Fluid							
VENDOR	BRAND OFFERED				DISCOUNT OFFERED	RECOMMENDED	
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	NO BID					N.B.	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Valvoline				10%		
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Power Service				15%		
Silver State Petroleum	Enviroolutions				5%		
Item #23 Diesel Exhaust Fluid							
VENDOR	BRAND OFFERED				DISCOUNT OFFERED	RECOMMENDED	
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Victory Blue				15%		
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Blue DEF				10%		
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Blue DEF				15%		
Silver State Petroleum	Victory Blue				5%		
Item #24 Gear Lubricant							
VENDOR	BRAND OFFERED				DISCOUNT OFFERED	RECOMMENDED	
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Shell, Phillips 66, Total				15%		
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Chevron				10%		
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Chevron				15%		
Silver State Petroleum	Shell - VP				5%		

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT						ATTACHMENT A	
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS							
BID # 094-11-03-19							
TABULATION							
Item #25 Grease							
VENDOR		BRAND OFFERED			DISCOUNT OFFERED		RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.		Shell, Phillips 66, Total			15%		
Hunt & Sons, Inc.		Chevron			10%		
Pilot Thomas Logistics		Chevron			15%		
Silver State Petroleum		Shell, VP			5%		
Item #26 Hydraulic Oil							
VENDOR		BRAND OFFERED			DISCOUNT OFFERED		RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.		Shell, Phillips 66, Total			15%		
Hunt & Sons, Inc.		Chevron			10%		
Pilot Thomas Logistics		Chevron			15%		
Silver State Petroleum		Shell - VP			5%		
Item #27 Motor Oil							
VENDOR		BRAND OFFERED			DISCOUNT OFFERED		RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.		Shell, Phillips 66, Total			15%		
Hunt & Sons, Inc.		Chevron			10%		
Pilot Thomas Logistics		Chevron			15%		
Silver State Petroleum		Shell - VP			5%		

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT				ATTACHMENT A		
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
Item #28 Power Steering Fluid						
VENDOR	BRAND OFFERED			DISCOUNT OFFERED		RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	NO BID					N.B.
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Valvoline				10%	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Power Service				15%	
Silver State Petroleum	Enviroolutions				5%	
Item #29 Transmission amd Drive Train						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION			DISCOUNT OFFERED		RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Shell, Phillips 66, Total				15%	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Chevron				10%	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Chevron				15%	
Silver State Petroleum	Shell - VP				5%	
Item #30 Transmission Fluid						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION			DISCOUNT OFFERED		RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Shell, Phillips 66, Total				15%	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Chevron				10%	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Chevron				15%	
Silver State Petroleum	Shell - VP				5%	

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT				ATTACHMENT A		
LUBRICATION PRODUCTS						
BID # 094-11-03-19						
TABULATION						
Item #31 Universa Tractor Fluid						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION				DISCOUNT OFFERED	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Shell, Phillips, Safety Kleen				15%	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Chevron				10%	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Chevron				15%	
Silver State Petroleum	Shell - VP				5%	
Item #32 Vehicle Antifreeze						
VENDOR	DESCRIPTION				DISCOUNT OFFERED	RECOMMENDED
Carson Valley Oil Co., Inc.	Shell				15%	
Hunt & Sons, Inc.	Chevron				10%	
Pilot Thomas Logistics	Chevron				15%	
Silver State Petroleum	Shell				5%	