



**Washoe County School District**

Purchasing Department • 14101 Old Virginia Road • Reno, NV 89521  
Phone (775) 850-8025 • Fax (775) 857-3175

**ADDENDUM #2 – QUESTIONS & ANSWERS**

**CERTAIN CAN LINERS  
RFB #054-14-07-20**

**July 9, 2019**

It is the prospective Bidder’s responsibility to read the entire bid and all appendices and to respond to all requirements completely. All other terms and conditions shall remain the same.

All prospective Bidders should acknowledge receipt of this Addendum by signing this document where noted and return it with the bid submission. Failure to acknowledge receipt of this Addendum may result in a rejection of bid.

The opening day has been changed. **The Opening Date is Friday, July 19 2019 at 2:00 p.m. (local time).**

\*\*\*\*\*

**QUESTIONS & ANSWERS:**

1. **QUESTION:** The two school districts listed for deliveries, will delivery be to a warehouse or individual schools?

**ANSWER:** Most of the deliveries will be to a warehouse, however, as specified in Section 24.1 of the RFB, WCSD reserves the right to ship to other locations as needed.

2. **QUESTION:** For Item 3 – 55-gallon can liner, is the color clear or dark?

**ANSWER:** Item 3 should be dark. Clear liners are no longer used.

3. **QUESTION:** In regards to the liner dimensions, do they have to be exact or will a crossover be accepted?

**ANSWER:** The dimensions have to be exact or close. If the dimensions are not exact, WCSD staff will determine if that item will be acceptable.

4. **QUESTION:** Will you accept liners with a “gauge” as thickness instead of “Mils”? This is all as long as the liner does not sacrifice size and/or weight?

**ANSWER:** Thickness must be measured in Mils.



**Washoe County School District**

---

**Purchasing Department • 14101 Old Virginia Road • Reno, NV 89521  
Phone (775) 850-8025 • Fax (775) 857-3175**

5. **QUESTION:** Based on previous ordering history and purchase orders, about how often are orders placed (monthly, quarterly or other?) And what is an approximate case order?

**ANSWER:** Orders are placed approximately four times per year and equal approximately  $\frac{1}{4}$  of the total estimated quantities listed in Section 34.0 of the bid.

6. **QUESTION:** Can we call FedEx at our expense and pick up a sample of each liner? If yes, Please provide us with the address where FedEx should go, a contact name, phone number, email address and the times that FedEx can come.

**ANSWER:** We are not providing samples of our current liners. Please see Attachment A for the items that were awarded on the previous bid.

7. **QUESTION:** Will all orders be placed with a PO from Washoe County Schools or will Churchill County School District issue their own PO's to awarded vendor?

**ANSWER:** Each agency will place their own PO's to awarded vendors. Washoe County School District will place their PO's and Churchill County School District will place their PO's.

8. **QUESTION:** Does Item #3 have a specified color?

**ANSWER:** Item 3 should be a dark color.

9. **QUESTION:** Deliveries are desired to be within 30 days after receipt of order. Is there a set order frequency?

**ANSWER:** Please refer to the answer for Question 5.

10. **QUESTION:** Could you tell me if these items have been bid on before?

**ANSWER:** Yes, these items have been on previous bids. Please see Attachment A showing the bid tabulation from the most recent bid.

11. **QUESTION:** Items for the liners calls for a gusseted bag but there are only two (2) dimensions? Gusseted bags would require a 3<sup>rd</sup> measurement. Do you happen to know if that information is available?

**ANSWER:** The measurements for Item 2 are approximately 33" W, 39" L, and 10.5" gusset.

12. **QUESTION:** On Item #2, I want to confirm that you want a Star Sealed Non-Gusseted Can Liner like the other 5 requested liners, rather than a Gusseted Liner. The Star Sealed liners will be far



**Washoe County School District**

---

**Purchasing Department • 14101 Old Virginia Road • Reno, NV 89521  
Phone (775) 850-8025 • Fax (775) 857-3175**

stronger than the Gusseted liner and the measurement included in the RFB was a Non-Gusseted measurement, which is the reason for the confusion.

**ANSWER: Item #2 should be gusseted.**

**13. QUESTION:** On Item #3 no color requirement is mentioned and since black is the most affordable option, is a black can liner acceptable for item #3?

**ANSWER: A black liner is acceptable for Item 3.**

**14. QUESTION:** The spec for Item #3 asks for a 2.7 mil thickness, which seems very heavy. Do you happen to know what these liners will be used for?

**ANSWER: These liners are used to hold trash, leaves, weeds, heavy outdoor debris, etc.**

**15. QUESTION:** Do you happen to have the manufacturer's part numbers for the can liners you are currently using? I can match my samples with them to ensure that we send you samples that are as comparable to what you are currently using as possible.

**ANSWER: Please see Attachment A showing the bid tabulation from the most recent bid that shows the products that were awarded.**

**16. QUESTION:** The existing contract for these items is likely public information, would you be able to share the current costs of these items for reference purposes?

**ANSWER: Please see Attachment A showing the bid tabulation from the most recent bid that shows the costs of the awarded items.**

**17. QUESTION:** Item #2 is listed to be packed in cases of 250 rolls per case. This will cause the cases to weight approximately 40 pounds per case. These liners are typically packaged 100/case, but I want to ensure the packaging is what is desired and most convenient to you all. Can you confirm that cases of 250 rolls weighing roughly 40 pounds/case are what you are interested in? Or would it be more convenient to pack Item #2 in smaller quantities per case?

**ANSWER: Item 2 should be packed in 250 rolls per case.**

**18. QUESTION:** Is there any requirement for liners to be flat packed in the boxes or in coreless rolls?

**ANSWER: Liners can be either flat packed or in coreless rolls.**

**19. QUESTION:** A couple of the exact sizes and/or mil's are nonstock and special order. I have no samples available for these. Will samples of similar size in exact mil and/or similar mil in exact size



**Washoe County School District**

**Purchasing Department • 14101 Old Virginia Road • Reno, NV 89521  
Phone (775) 850-8025 • Fax (775) 857-3175**

be acceptable? On the 33 x 39 1.8 clear, I have the same bag in a black. Would this sample be acceptable?

**ANSWER: The samples provided should be the exact item that is being bid.**

**20. QUESTION:** Are there Loading docks at the locations or is a lift gate and/or inside delivery necessary?

**ANSWER: There is a loading dock at the WCSD warehouse, but not all WCSD locations have loading docks, so a lift gate may be necessary for some orders.**

**21. QUESTION:** Can you give us an idea of how many cases of trash bags are ordered at a time? Do you have a past PO we can review?

**ANSWER: Please see the answer for Question 5 regarding the order quantities. We do not have a previous PO for review.**

\*\*\*\*\*

**ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT – Please return signed copy of Addendum #2 with RFB submission packet.**

\_\_\_\_\_  
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE

\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE

\_\_\_\_\_  
PRINT NAME

\_\_\_\_\_  
TITLE

\_\_\_\_\_  
PROPOSING FIRM NAME

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT															
CERTAIN CAN LINERS															
BID #054-03-08-16															
TABULATION															
<u>KEY:</u>															
I.S. INSUFFICIENT SPECS	NO SPEC. NO SPECIFICATIONS														
L.P. LOCAL PREFERENCE	NO SUB. NO SUBSTITUTIONS ALLOWED														
N.A. NOT AVAILABLE	N.S. NO SAMPLE														
N.A.S. NOT AS SPECIFIED	R.A.B. REJECT ALL BIDS														
N.B. NO BID	* RECOMMENDED														
N.C. NO CHARGE	** CHOSEN BY LOTTERY														
BUYER HAS REVIEWED AND APPROVED Pat Jeffers DATE August 17, 2015															
APPEAL WINDOW CLOSING ON 5:00 P.M. on Monday August 24, 2015															
<b>ITEM #1 CAN LINER, Low Density, Polyethylene, 15 Gallon, 24" x 32", 1.0 mil Minimum Thickness, Dark Color, Non-Gusseted Seal. 500/Case (WCSD #271/1150)</b>															
	A-1 Chemical	A-1 Chemical Alternate	Ace Janitorial Supply	All American Poly	Brady Industries	Caltex	ePoly Star	Global Supply	Independent Poly Sales	Interboro Packaging Corp.	JC Paper	Mega Link Dist.	Unisource	Unisource Alternate	Waxie
Total Qty - 2500 cases	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500	2500
Mfg/Model #	Winzer SB16	Winzer 865-23-3309 (23 X 33)	LR243210K	243210-AAP	CMI #LA3231	Caltex LD321D	ePolyStar PSL-F2432-1B500	Tristar	Republic Bag LLDPE	Aluf INT-2432-HVY	Republic FLTL 24321	Wardley 2432F/1.0K	Berry PGR2432XB	Shields SB-16	Pitt Plastic EC2432 09K
Mil Thickness	1 mil	.9 mil Green	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	.9 mil
Case Count	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500	500
As Needed	\$32.02	\$25.90	\$27.32	\$26.48	\$23.60	\$25.34	N/B	\$22.20	N/B	\$20.24	\$25.31	N/B	\$29.46	\$25.59	\$32.88
Recycled As Needed	\$32.02	\$25.90	\$27.32	\$26.48	\$23.60	\$25.34	\$21.30	\$20.85	\$25.11	\$20.24	N/B	\$23.81	\$29.46	\$25.59	N/B
Recommended							*	N.A.S.		N.A.S.					
Total	\$80,050.00	\$64,750.00	\$68,300.00	\$66,200.00	\$59,000.00	\$63,350.00	\$53,250.00	\$52,125.00	\$62,775.00	\$50,600.00	\$63,275.00	\$59,525.00	\$73,650.00	\$63,975.00	\$82,200.00

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT										ATTACHMENT A (Addendum 2 for RFB 054-14-07-20)					
CERTAIN CAN LINERS															
BID #054-03-08-16															
ITEM #2 CAN LINER, Low Density, Polyethylene, 32-40 Gallon, 33" x 39", 1.8 mil Minimum Thickness, Dark Color and or Clear, Gusseted Seal. 250/Case. (WCSD #271/1160)															
	A-1 Chemical	A-1 Chemical Alternate	Ace Janitorial Supply	All American Poly	Brady Industries	Caltex	ePoly Star	Global Supply	Independent Poly Sales	Interboro Packaging Corp.	JC Paper	Mega Link Dist.	Unisource	Unisource Alternate	Waxie
Total Qty - 5000 cases	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000	5000
Mfg/Model #	Winzer SB3032	NO BID	LR333910K 33 X 39	333918-AAP	CMI #LA3911	Caltex LD3918D	ePolyStar PSL-F3339-18B250	Tristar	Republic Bag LLDPE	Aluf INT-3339-EXH	Republic FLTL 333918	Wardley 3339G/1.8K	Berry VLR3340-200B	Shields Special	Pitt Plastic EC333919K
Mil Thickness	1.8 mil		1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil	1.7 mil	1.8 mil	1.8 mil
Case Count	250		250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	100 (\$15.46)	250	200 (41.21)
As Needed - Black	\$43.45		\$33.89	\$32.19	\$37.71	\$33.99	N/B	\$34.05	N/B	\$29.94	\$38.17	N/B	\$38.65	\$38.61	\$51.51
As Needed - Clear			\$39.91	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B	N/B
Recycled As Needed	\$43.45		N/B	\$32.19	\$37.71	\$33.99	\$31.92	\$31.99	\$37.85	\$29.94	N/B	\$32.05	\$15.46 (\$38.65)	\$38.61	N/B
Recommended							N.A.S.	*		N.A.S.					
Total	\$217,250.00	\$0.00	\$169,450.00	\$160,950.00	\$188,550.00	\$169,950.00	\$159,600.00	\$159,950.00	\$189,250.00	\$149,700.00	\$190,850.00	\$160,250.00	\$193,250.00	\$193,050.00	\$257,550.00
ITEM #3 CAN LINER, Low Density, 55 Gallon, Polyethylene, 38" x 58", 2.7 mil Minimum Thickness, Non-Gusseted. 100/Case. (WCSD #271/1240)															
	A-1 Chemical	A-1 Chemical Alternate	Ace Janitorial Supply	All American Poly	Brady Industries	Caltex	ePoly Star	Global Supply	Independent Poly Sales	Interboro Packaging Corp.	JC Paper	Mega Link Dist.	Unisource	Unisource Alternate	Waxie
Total Qty - 900 cases	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900	900
Mfg/Model #	Winzer SB3858	Winzer 865-38-5840 38 X 58	L385827K 36 X 58	385827-AAP	CMI #LA5810	Caltex LD3858D	ePolyStar PSL-F3858-27B100	Tristar	Republic Bag LLDPE	Aluf INT-3858-Super EX-HVY	Republic FLTL 385827	Wardley 3858F/2.7K	Berry LBR3858X5B	Shields Special	Pitt Plastic EC385827K
Mil Thickness	2.7 mil	4.0 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil	2.0 mil	2.7 mil	2.7 mil
Case Count	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	50 (\$25.75)
As Needed	\$41.38	\$56.40	\$34.31	\$34.74	\$37.44	\$36.92	N/B	\$35.83	N/B	\$30.68	\$39.15	N/B	\$32.23	\$38.81	\$51.50
Recycled As Needed	\$41.38	\$56.40	N/B	\$34.74	\$37.44	\$36.92	\$33.32	\$33.65	\$38.83	\$30.68	N/B	\$32.95	\$32.23	\$38.81	N/B
Recommended										N.A.S.		*	N.A.S.		
Total	\$37,242.00	\$50,760.00	\$30,879.00	\$31,266.00	\$33,696.00	\$33,228.00	\$29,988.00	\$30,285.00	\$34,947.00	\$27,612.00	\$35,235.00	\$29,655.00	\$29,007.00	\$34,929.00	\$46,350.00

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT										ATTACHMENT A (Addendum 2 for RFB 054-14-07-20)					
CERTAIN CAN LINERS															
BID #054-03-08-16															
ITEM #4 CAN LINER, Low Density, 20 Gallon, Polyethylene, 30" x 36", 1.0 mil Minimum Thickness, Dark Color, Non Gusseted. 250/Case. (CCSD)															
	A-1 Chemical	A-1 Chemical Alternate	Ace Janitorial Supply	All American Poly	Brady Industries	Caltex	ePoly Star	Global Supply	Independent Poly Sales	Interboro Packaging Corp.	JC Paper	Mega Link Dist.	Unisource	Unisource Alternate	Waxie
Total Qty - 150 cases	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150	150
Mfg/Model #	Winzer SB3032	NO BID	LR303610K 30 X 36	303610-AAP	CMI #LA3601	Caltex LD3036D	ePolyStar PSL-SR3036-1B250	Tristar	Republic Bag LLDPE	Aluf INT-3036-X-HVY	Republic FLTL 303610	Wardley 3036F/1.0K	Berry PGR3036XB	Shields Special	Pitt Plastic EC303609K
Mil Thickness	1.0 mil		1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	1.0 mil	.9 mil
Count Per Case	250		250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250	250
As Needed	\$22.56		\$19.97	\$18.61	\$17.20	\$18.36	N/B	\$17.20	N/B	\$16.84	\$20.79	N/B	\$18.69	\$18.39	\$20.96
Recycled As Needed	\$22.56		N/B	\$18.61	\$17.20	\$18.36	\$17.22	\$16.15	\$17.65	\$16.84	N/B	\$22.30	\$18.69	\$18.39	N/B
Recommended								*							
Total	\$3,384.00	\$0.00	\$2,995.50	\$2,791.50	\$2,580.00	\$2,754.00	\$2,583.00	\$2,422.50	\$2,647.50	\$2,526.00	\$3,118.50	\$3,345.00	\$2,803.50	\$2,758.50	\$3,144.00
ITEM #5 CAN LINER, Low Density, 40-45 Gallon, Polyethylene, 40" X 46", 2.0 mil Minimum Thickness, Dark Color, Non-Gusseted. 100/Case. (CCSD)															
	A-1 Chemical	A-1 Chemical	Ace Janitorial Supply	All American Poly	Brady Industries	Caltex	ePoly Star	Global Supply	Independent Poly Sales	Interboro Packaging Corp.	JC Paper	Mega Link Dist.	Unisource	Unisource Alternate	Waxie
Total Qty - 300 cases	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300	300
Mfg/Model #	Winzer SB25	NO BID	L404620K 40 X 46	404620-AAP	CMI #20-40X482M	Caltex LD4046D	ePolyStar PSL-F4046-2B100	Tristar	Republic Bag LLDPE	Aluf INT-4046-Super XH	Republic FLTL 40462	Wardley 4046F/2.0K	Berry PGR4046X5 B	Shields Special	Pitt Plastic EC404620K
Mil Thickness	2.0mil		2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil
Case Count	100		100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	Not Stated
As Needed	\$25.64		\$27.93	\$20.07	\$23.49	\$23.28	N/B	\$22.80	N/B	\$20.68	\$24.22	N/B	\$25.84	\$24.55	\$30.68
Recycled As Needed	\$25.64		N/B	\$20.07	\$23.49	\$23.28	\$23.15	\$21.43	\$24.02	\$20.68	N/B	\$27.60	\$25.84	\$24.55	N/B
Recommended				N.A.S.						*					
Total	\$7,692.00	\$0.00	\$8,379.00	\$6,021.00	\$7,047.00	\$6,984.00	\$6,945.00	\$6,840.00	\$7,206.00	\$6,204.00	\$7,266.00	\$8,280.00	\$7,752.00	\$7,365.00	\$9,204.00

WASHOE COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT										ATTACHMENT A (Addendum 2 for RFB 054-14-07-20)					
CERTAIN CAN LINERS															
BID #054-03-08-16															
ITEM #6 CAN LINER, Low Density, 55-60 Gallon, Polyethylene, 36" X 58", 2.0mil Minimum Thickness, Dark Color, Non- Gusseted Seal. 100/CS. (CCSD-100)															
	A-1 Chemical	A-1 Chemical	Ace Janitorial Supply	All American Poly	Brady Industries	Caltex	ePoly Star	Global Supply	Independent Poly Sales	Interboro Packaging Corp.	JC Paper	Mega Link Dist.	Unisource	Unisource Alternate	Waxie
Total Qty - 100 cases	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100
Mfg/Model #	Winzer SB55	NO BID	L365820K 36 X 58	365820-AAP	CMI #LA5861	Caltex LD3658D	ePolyStar PSL-F3658-2B100	Tristar	Republic Bag LLDPE	Aluf INT-3658-Super EXH	Republic FLTL 365820	Wardley 3658F/2.0K	Berry LBR3858X5B	Shields Special	Pitt Plastic EC385820K
Mil Thickness	2.0 mil		2.0 mil	2.0 mil	Not Stated	2.0 mil	2 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil	2.0 mil
Case Count	100		100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	100	50 (\$18.33)
As Needed	\$29.08		\$24.93	\$22.78	\$25.44	\$26.50	N/B	\$26.57	N/B	\$21.82	\$27.49	N/B	\$32.23	\$27.85	\$37.26
Recycled As Needed	\$29.08		N/B	\$22.78	\$25.44	\$26.50	\$29.72	\$24.99	\$27.26	\$21.82	N/B	\$30.45	\$32.23	\$27.85	N/B
Recommended			N.A.S.	N.A.S.	*			N.A.S.		N.A.S.					
Total	\$2,908.00	\$0.00	\$2,493.00	\$2,278.00	\$2,544.00	\$2,650.00	\$2,972.00	\$2,657.00	\$2,726.00	\$2,182.00	\$2,749.00	\$3,045.00	\$3,223.00	\$2,785.00	\$3,726.00